
Pilar Campins Falcó 
 
 
 

Pilar Campíns-Falcó (Prof. P. Campins-Falco; WOK-Researcher ID: B-8943-2008 
(Thomson Reuters). Other Names: Campinsfalco P; Falco PC; URL: 
http://www.researcherid.com/rid/B-8943-2008) got the BSc degree in Chemistry in the 
Faculty of Chemistry of the Universitat de València (1976-1981), and the Ph. D. in the 
same university (1985) with Doctorate  Award.  From  January  2002,  she  is  
Professor  of  Analytic  Chemistry  in  the Faculty of Chemistry in Universitat de 
València. She has given lectures in the Faculties of Chemistry, Biology, Pharmacy  and  
in  the  Superior  Technical  School  of  Engineering  at  degree  and postgraduate 
levels.  
She has supervised fifteen research projects sponsored by public organizations in 
competitive  announcements  and  related  to  clinic  studies  in  drug  design  and  
tumor markers, as well as environmental studies as regards priority and emerging 
pollutants. The current  projects  deals  with  the  design  of new strategies for 
developing  in situ cost-effective  dispositives and   capillary  liquid  chromatography  
and nanochromatography analyzers in order to monitorize and characterize the 
environment and human security .  
She has contributed to the discipline by introducing new concepts about calibration, 
accuracy,  and  quality  of  the  analytical  results,  multiresidue  analysis  and  liquid 
chromatography. She is the leader of a consolidated research group  “miniaturization 
and total methods of analysis” (MINTOTA: htpp://www.uv.es/mintota) created in 1988, 
and has established collaborations with other research groups of the Universitat de 
València,and with other Spanish and European universities, and develops activities 
dealing with knowledge  and  technology  transfer  with  companies,  autonomic  
organizations  and research  centres.  She  is  co-author  of  more  than  200  scientific  
publications,  such  as articles in specialized international magazines and different 
book chapters, and she has participated  in  numerous  scientific  congresses.  She has 
co-supervised ten doctoral thesis. She has also experience on university management, 
and at the present moment. She is the Vice-rector of research of the University of 
Valencia from april 2014. She is a reviewer in JCR journals magazines of the discipline 
and evaluator of several quality agencies (ANECA, ANEP, AGAUR, ACECAU, AAC 
and AQUIB) and commissions. 

 


